



**Wastewater Treatment Utility**  
500 South River Road  
West Lafayette, Indiana 47906-4377  
Phone: 765.775.5145  
Fax: 765.775.5149

To: Board of Public Works and Safety

From: Dave Henderson, Utility Director

Re: Disinfection Chemical Purchasing for 2012

Once again we have partnered with the City of Lafayette to purchase chemicals for our wastewater treatment plants.

The City of Lafayette has awarded both Sodium Hypochlorite and Sodium Bisulfite to Brenntag Mid-South.

I request Board approval to follow suit and award both chemicals to Brenntag Mid-South.

The following justification for the award is as follows:

- PVS Chemical did not honor their bid last year.
- Brenntag has a 1-day lead time for orders, while Alexander Chemical has a 3-day lead time for orders.
- Brenntag deliveries are made out of Terre Haute, Indiana, while PVS and Alexander deliveries are based out of Illinois

Thank you for your consideration.

2012 Chemical Bid Tabulations  
Sodium Hypochlorite, Sodium Bisulfite, Hydrochloric Acid

*Voluntary Only  
Pool Chemical*

<u>Vendor/Response</u>	<u>Sodium Hypochlorite</u>	<u>Sodium Bisulfite</u>	<u>Hydrochloric Acid</u>
Alexander Chemical On Time	\$0.695 Gal	\$1.413 Gal	No Bid
Brenttag Mid-South On Time	\$0.700 Gal	\$1.365 Gal	\$82.50 Drum
Hydrite Chemical On Time	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
KA Steel Chemicals On Time	\$0.760 Gal	No Bid	No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals On Time	\$0.727 Gal	\$1.520 Gal	No Bid
PVS Chemical Solutions On Time	No Bid	\$1.147 Gal	No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals On Time	No Bid	No Bid	\$141.75 Drum
Rowell Chemical On Time	\$0.749 Gal	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Last Years Award:</b>			
	\$0.626 Gal	\$1.155 Gal	\$82.50 Drum

Note: PVS Chemical reneged their bid in last years event